

CHEMICAL BID SUMMARY
Chemicals for Ellis Creek WRF
FY 2024/2025

Attachment 2

	Ferric Cl	Hypochlorite	Bisulfite	Aluminum Chlorohydrate	Polydyne C-6288 (or equivalent)	Polydyne WE-2273 (or equivalent)
Chemical Vendor	43%	12.5%	25%	50%	250 gallon tote	250 gallon tote
	(dry ton)	(gallon)	(gallon)	(pound)	(gallon)	(gallon)
Brenntag Pacific			no bid			
USALCO				\$0.4700		
Chemurgic			no bid			
HASA		no bid				
Heimbürger & Company			NR			
Kemira Water Solutions	\$1,550.00					
Olin		\$3.10				
Pennco	\$1,440.00					
SNF/Polydyne					\$16.847	\$17.045
Thatcher Co. of CA		\$2.49				
Univar		\$3.35	\$2.400			

Previous Fiscal Year Prices

FY 24-25	\$1,440.00	\$2.49	\$2.400	\$0.470	\$16.847	\$17.045
FY 23-24	\$1,397.00	\$1.82	\$2.450	\$0.463	\$16.290	\$16.480
FY 22-23	\$1,195.00	\$1.62	\$1.795	\$0.432	\$15.360	\$15.540
FY 21-22	\$900.00	\$0.6586	\$1.120	\$0.267	\$12.565	\$12.565
FY 20-21	\$810.00	\$0.695	\$1.090	no bid	\$11.686	\$11.686
FY 19-20	\$840.00	\$0.6820	\$1.1300	\$0.252	\$10.0350	\$10.1140
FY 18-19	\$756.00	\$0.6540	\$1.0530	\$0.264	\$9.3800	\$9.6480
FY 17-18	\$500.00	\$0.5290	\$1.0296	\$0.25	\$7.6495	\$7.6495

no bid; bid in prior years

NR; non-responsive bid

<i>FY 22-23</i>	\$1,195.000	\$1.62	\$1.795	\$0.432	\$15.360
<i>FY 21-22</i>	\$900.000	\$0.6586	\$1.120	\$0.267	\$12.565
% increase	33%	146%	60%	62%	22%
Avg % inc	0.58				

annual budget

Hypo	
Bisulfite	
Ferric	
ACH	
(C-6288)	
(WE-2273)	

YOY % 13.50%

last year budget 1,237,601.75
this year \$1,404,638.83

Annual percentage increase	ACH price/gallon				
Ferric		Hypo	Bisulfite		ACH
3.08%	3.08%	36.81%	-2.04%		1.51%
\$545,310.00					
\$105,120.00					

\$173,448.00

\$105,750.00

\$31,840.83

\$443,170.00

\$1,404,638.83

\$15.540

\$12.565

24%

c6288

we2273

3.42%

3.43%